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Seattle, Washington’s Stoup 
Brewing has fi nished an 
expansion project that see’s 
the opening of a 6,000 sq. ft. 
production space adjacent 
to the existing brewery and 
taproom. The Ballard neighbor-
hood brewery has become a 
popular destination that’s con-
tinually sought to fi nd more 
room in their limited space.

More from a press release:

Located on the ground fl oor of 
a new building that sits directly 
behind Stoup’s 2000 square 
foot beer garden, the new 
space has allowed the Stoup 
team to move all the bright 
tanks, keg washing, cold stor-
age, and packaging out of 
the brewery. 

Brewing remains in the original 
3000 square foot space and 
with the addition of new fer-
menters, Stoup will ultimately 
triple production. 

“We want to take things slow 
and not overextend ourselves 
right now,” said Brad Benson, 
co-owner and head brewer. 
“ But we do plan to focus on 
expanding our barrel aged pro-
gram in the very near future.”

“We also plan to be more than 
a draft only brewery,” adds 
Robyn Schumacher, co-owner 
and brewer. “Our intention is 
to offer packaged beers in the 
fi rst quarter of 2020.”

“The new space is great for 
special projects we’ve been 
wanting to tackle,” said Lara 
Zahaba, co-owner. “We’re 



excited to start experimenting 
with more mixed culture and 
sour beers.”

In fi ve short years, Stoup has 
gone from having three beers 
on tap to a rotating selection 
of 21, from making 24 different 
beers a year to 80, and from 
producing 1,700 barrels to 
6,000. Stoup has also more 
than doubled their wholesale 
accounts.

In addition, they’ve been 
honored with numerous 
awards and accolades, and a 
loyal following. It’s very excit-
ing to think about what they’ll 
create with an additional 6000 

square feet of production 
space. Stay tuned!

Opened in 2013 by Brad Ben-
son, Lara Zahaba, and Robyn 
Schumacher, Stoup Brewing is 
a family friendly craft brewery 
located in Ballard’s Brewery 
District. Revered for their 
dedication and innovation to 
the art and science of making 
beer, Stoup has a garnered 
numerous awards and a 
devoted following. With up to 
21 beers on tap, an inviting 
year round beer garden, private 
event space, and a rotating 
selection of food trucks, Stoup 
is a welcoming destination for 
the beer enthusiast of every 
level. Root beer fans welcome 
too! Stoup opens Monday 
through Thursday at 3pm and 
Friday, Saturday, and Sunday 
at 12pm. To learn more, visit 
www.stoupbrewing.com.

Stoup Brewing is located 
at 1108 NW 52nd Street in 
Seattle, Washington.


